
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

SALISBURY CITY COUNCIL 
WORK SESSION AGENDA 

------------- 
AUGUST 1, 2016 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS, Room 301 
GOVERNMENT OFFICE BUILDING 

 
 

3:00 p.m. 
 
 

SPECIAL MEETING  
 
WORK SESSION  

  
3:30 p.m.  Community Parks & Playground Grant Application – Deborah Stam  
  
3:45 p.m. Rt. 13/Dagsboro Rd Annexation – William Holland 
  
4:15 p.m. Amending the Building Code – William Holland 
  
4:45 p.m. Council discussion 
  
5:00 p.m. Adjournment 
  
  

 
Times shown are approximate. Council reserves the right to adjust the agenda as circumstances warrant.  

The Council reserves the right to convene in Closed Session as permitted under the Annotated Code of Maryland 10-508(a). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Posted: 7/27/16 



























RESOLUTION NO.  __________ 1 
 2 
 3 
 A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND TO APPROVE A 4 
MARYLAND DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES, COMMUNITY PARKS & 5 
PLAYGROUNDS GRANT APPLICATION FOR FUNDING FOR TWO PROJECTS; PHASE 2 OF 6 
THE SALISBURY SKATEPARK, AND FUNDING ASSISTANCE FOR THE WEST 7 
SALISBURY LITTLE LEAGUE BALL FIELD LIGHTING PROJECT. 8 
 9 
 WHEREAS,  the Maryland Department of Natural Resources (DNR) has solicited 10 
applications from eligible jurisdictions to apply for funding under the Community Parks & 11 
Playgrounds (CP&P) Program for Fiscal Year 2018; and 12 
 13 

WHEREAS,  the City of Salisbury is eligible to apply for CP&P funds from DNR; and 14 
 15 

WHEREAS,  the Council of the City of Salisbury recognizes the important role that our local  16 
parks, playgrounds and recreational areas play in maintaining a healthy, pleasant, attractive  17 
environment for the enjoyment of our local residents; and 18 
 19 
 WHEREAS,  the Council wishes to rehabilitate, improve and expand the parks, playgrounds 20 
and recreational areas within the City of Salisbury in order to improve the quality of life for all 21 
citizens; and 22 
 23 
 WHEREAS,  DNR has awarded a Community Parks & Playgrounds grant in the amount of 24 
$262,000 to the City of Salisbury for the Salisbury Skatepark, Phase 1 (CPP # 5980-22-206). 25 
 26 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT,  the Council of the City of Salisbury, 27 
Maryland does hereby authorize the submission of an application to the Maryland Department of 28 
Natural Resources for Community Parks & Playgrounds (CP&P) funds to forward the City’s 29 
recreational initiatives.  This will be accomplished by applying for CP&P funds for two projects; 30 
$180,000 for the Salisbury Skatepark, Phase 2, and $25,000 for the West Salisbury Little League Ball 31 
Field Lighting Project. 32 
 33 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT, Jacob R. Day, Mayor, is authorized and empowered 34 
to execute any and all documents required for the submission of this grant application. 35 
  36 
 THE ABOVE RESOLUTION was introduced and duly passed at a meeting of the Council of 37 
the City of Salisbury, Maryland held on August 8, 2016, and is to become effective immediately. 38 
 39 
 40 
 41 
______________________________   ____________________________ 42 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath  43 
CITY CLERK      CITY COUNCIL PRESIDENT 44 
 45 
 46 
APPROVED BY ME THIS 47 
 48 
___________  day of August, 2016. 49 
 50 
 51 
________________________________ 52 
Jacob R. Day 53 
MAYOR 54 





















































































Ordinance No. ______ 1 
 2 
 AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY AMENDING SECTIONS 8.11.020 3 
OF CHAPTER 8.11 THE FIRE PREVENTION CODE; 15.04.010 OF CHAPTER 15.04 4 
BUILDING CODE, 15.12.020 OF CHAPTER 15.12 ELECTRICAL STANDARDS; 15.24.040 5 
OF CHAPTER 15.24 HOUSING STANDARDS. 6 
 7 
 WHEREAS, the ongoing application, administration and enforcement of Title 8, Health 8 
and Safety, and Title 15, Buildings and Construction, of the Salisbury Municipal Code, 9 
demonstrates a need for its periodic review, evaluation and amendment to keep them current; and 10 
 11 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council may amend Chapter 15.04, Building Code, 12 
pursuant to the authority granted in SC 2-15 of the Salisbury City Charter and § 12-501, et seq. 13 
of the Public Safety Article, Maryland Annotated Code and related COMAR regulations; and 14 
 15 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council have requested that the Department of 16 
Building, Permits and Inspections periodically review the Code in light of existing building 17 
trends and practices and code updates; and 18 
 19 
 WHEREAS, the Department of Building, Permits and Inspections does recommend 20 
approval of the proposed code changes. 21 
 22 
 NOW, THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained by the Council of the City of 23 
Salisbury, Maryland, that Sections 8.11.020 of Chapter 8.11 the Fire Prevention Code; 15.04.010 24 
and 15.04.020 of Chapter 15.04 Building Code, 15.12.020 of Chapter 15.12 Electrical Standards; 25 
15.24.040 of Chapter 15.24 Housing Standards be amended as follows: 26 
 27 
 28 
Chapter 8.11 - The Fire Prevention Code 29 
 30 
 31 
 32 
8.11.020 - Amendments to the State Fire Prevention Code.  33 
 34 

A. The NFPA 101 Life Safety Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is 35 
adopted with state amendments with the exception of COMAR 20.06.04 - Fees for Fire 36 
Prevention Services.  37 

 38 
B. The NFPA 1 Fire Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is adopted 39 

with state and local amendments. The local amendments are:  40 
     1. The Board of Appeals shall be the Building Board of Adjustments & Appeals. 41 

2. Any person who fails to comply with the provisions of the Code or who fails to 42 
carry out an order made pursuant to this Code or violates any condition attached 43 
to a permit, approval, or certificate may be subject to a municipal infraction not to 44 
exceed $500.00 each day the violation continues.  45 



3. Failure to comply with the time limits of an abatement notice or other corrective 46 
notice issued by the authority having jurisdiction may result in municipal 47 
infractions not to exceed $500.00 each day the violation/s continues and the 48 
jurisdiction shall have authority as provided by law to evacuate, vacate and order 49 
such building or structure to be closed to the public.  50 

4. Amend Section 10.11 Open Flame, Candles, Open Fires and Incinerators, to read: 51 
Open burning is prohibited within the City.  52 

 53 
C.  The International Building Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is 54 

adopted with state and local amendments.  55 
 56 
 57 
 58 
Chapter 15.04 - BUILDING CODE  59 
 60 
 61 
 15.04.010 - Adoption of standard codes.  62 
 63 
     The City of Salisbury adopts the following Standard Codes:  64 
 65 
     A. International Building Code (2015) (IBC); 66 
     B. International Residential Code (2015) (IRC); 67 
     C. International Energy Conservation Code (2015 edition)(IECC); 68 
     D. International Mechanical Code (2015)(IMC); 69 
     E. International Plumbing Code (2015)(IPC); 70 
     F. International Fuel Gas Code (2015)(IFGC); and 71 
     G.   International Existing Building Code (2015); and 72 
     H.   Maryland Accessibility Code. 73 
 74 
 75 
 76 
 77 
Chapter 15.12 - Electrical Standards 78 
 79 
 80 
15.12.020 - Adoption of standards by reference.  81 
 82 
            Except as may be provided otherwise in this chapter, the current requirements of the 83 
National Electrical Code (2014 EDITION), as revised from time to time, being the regulations of 84 
the National Board of Fire Underwriters for electric wiring and apparatus, shall be deemed to be 85 
the requirements imposed by this chapter, such National Electrical Code, as revised from time to 86 
time, being hereby adopted by reference as the electrical code of the city and being herein 87 
incorporated in its entirety by reference.  88 
 89 
 90 
 91 



Chapter 15.24 - Housing Standards 92 
 93 
 94 
15.24.040 - Referenced standards.  95 
 96 

A. Where the following codes are referenced within this code, they shall be considered part 97 
of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference:  98 
 99 
1. International Building Code (2015) (IBC). The following additions and deletions 100 

are made to the International Building Code (2015):  101 
  a.  Chapter 1, Section 101.2.1 Appendix and replace with the following:  102 
 Paragraph 101.2.1 Appendix provisions on Appendix I, Patio Covers, and Appendix B, 103 
Board of Appeals are adopted as part of the IBC.  104 
 105 
  b.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.1 Gas.  106 
  c.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  107 
  d.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance.  108 
  e.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection.  109 
  f.  Chapter 1, delete:  110 
 111 
 Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. 112 
  113 
 2. Fences not over six feet (6') high.  114 
 115 
 Replace with the following:  116 
 117 
 105.2 Work exempt from permit.  118 
 119 
 2. Fences less than fifty (50) lineal feet.  120 
 121 
  g.  Chapter 1, add Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit:  122 
 123 
 14. Replacement windows, doors, vinyl/aluminum siding and custom trim.  124 
 125 
 Exception: Windows being replaced in bedrooms shall not be reduced in size or shall 126 
comply with the minimum requirements of Section 102.6 Existing Structures.  127 
 128 
  h.  Chapter 1, delete Section 110.3.5 Lath and Gypsum Board Inspection.  129 
 2. International Residential Code (2015)(IRC); 130 
 3. International Energy Conservation Code (2015)(IECC); 131 
 4. International Mechanical Code (2015)(IMC); 132 
 5. International Plumbing Code (2015)(IPC); 133 
 6. International Fuel Gas Code (2015)(IFGC); 134 
 7. International Existing Building Code (2015(IEBC)). 135 
 6.  Maryland Accessibility Code. 136 
 7.  National Electric Code (2009). 137 



 8.  National Fuel Gas Code 2009 Edition. 138 
9.  National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) 101 Life Safety Code (2009) is 139 
incorporated by reference, and is adopted with state amendments with the exception of 140 
COMAR 20.06.04 - Fees for Fire Prevention Services.  141 
10.  National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Fire Code (2009) is incorporated by 142 
reference, and is adopted with state and local amendments. The local amendments are:  143 

 a.  The Board of Appeals shall be the Building Board of Adjustments & Appeals. 144 
b.  Any person who fails to comply with the provisions of the Code or who fails to carry 145 
out an order made pursuant to this Code or violates any condition attached to a permit 146 
approval, or certificate may be subject to a municipal infraction not to exceed $500.00 147 
each day the violation continues.  148 
c.  Failure to comply with the time limits of an abatement notice or other corrective 149 
notice issued by the authority having jurisdiction may result in municipal infractions not 150 
to exceed $500.00 each day the violation/s continues and the jurisdiction shall have 151 
authority as provided by law to evacuate, vacate and order such building or structure to 152 
be closed to the public.  153 
d.  Amend Section 10.11 Open Flame, Candles, Open Fires and Incinerators, to read: 154 
Open burning is prohibited within the City.  155 

 11.  State of Maryland Fire Protection Code (2009). 156 
 157 

B. Where differences occur between provisions of this code and referenced standards, this 158 
code shall apply. Additionally, nothing herein shall be construed to repeal, modify or set 159 
aside any provisions of the city's zoning code.  160 

 161 
 162 
 AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE 163 
CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND, that the Ordinance shall take effect ___________ ____, 164 
2016. 165 
 166 
 THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 167 
Salisbury held on the ______ day of ___________, 2016 and thereafter, a statement of the 168 
substance of the ordinance having been published as required by law, in the meantime, was 169 
finally passed by the Council on the ___ day of _____________, 2016.  170 
 171 
ATTEST: 172 

 173 
_________________________   _________________________ 174 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk   John R. Heath, City Council President 175 
 176 
 177 
 178 
Approved by me, this ________day of ______________, 2016. 179 
 180 
 181 
__________________________ 182 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor  183 


	Agenda

	Community              Parks & Playground Grant Application 
 
	Rt. 13/ Dagsboro Rd Annexation

	Amending           Building Code


