
 

 

 

 

 

CITY OF SALISBURY 
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 
 

 

August 8, 2016                                      6:00 p.m. 
Government Office Building Room 301 
 

Times shown for agenda items are estimates only. 
 

 

6:00 p.m. CALL TO ORDER 
  
6:01 p.m. WELCOME/ANNOUNCEMENTS 
  
6:03 p.m. CITY INVOCATION – Associate Pastor Bill Reid of Parkway Church of God  
  
6:05 p.m. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE  
  
6:07 p.m. PRESENTATIONS  
 • Proclamation – Recognizing Jim Magill’s service to Salisbury/Wicomico Planning and 

Zoning Board 
• Community Organization presentation – United Way of the Lower Eastern Shore- 

presented by Executive Director Kathleen Momme 
  
6:25 p.m. ADOPTION OF LEGISLATIVE AGENDA 
  
6:27 p.m. CONSENT AGENDA –City Clerk Kim Nichols 
 • Resolution No. 2652  – to approve a Maryland Department of Natural Resources, 

Community Parks & Playgrounds Grant application for funding for two projects; Phase 
2 of the Salisbury Skatepark, and funding assistance for the West Salisbury Little 
League Ball Field Lighting Project 

  
6:30 p.m. RESOLUTION – City Administrator Tom Stevenson 
 • Resolution No. 2653 - to establish a Human Rights Advisory Committee 
  
6:35 p.m. PUBLIC HEARING/2nd READING ORDINANCE NO. 2393 – City Attorney Mark Tilghman  
 • Ordinance No. 2393 -2nd reading- pursuant to Chapter 17.228 of Title 17, Zoning of the 

Salisbury Municipal Code and Section 4.04 of Article 66b of the Annotated Code of 
Maryland for the purpose of amending Section 17.84.020 to add apartments, up to four 
units, in the Office and Service Residential District 

  
  



6:45 p.m. ORDINANCES – City Attorney Mark Tilghman 
 • Ordinance No.2396 -2nd reading- to designate no and restricted parking zones on a 

portion of Prince Street between Roger Street and Spring Avenue and on Spring 
Avenue between Prince Street and Bethel Street 

 • Ordinance No. 2397 - 1st reading- amending Sections 8.11.020 of Chapter 8.11 The Fire 
Prevention Code; 15.04.010 of Chapter 15.04 Building Code, 15.12.020 of Chapter 15.12 
Electrical Standards; 15.24.040 of Chapter 15.24 Housing Standards 

 • Ordinance No. 2398 -1st reading- approving an amendment of the FY17 Budget to 
appropriate funds for traffic equipment repairs and maintenance 

 • Ordinance No. 2399 - 1st reading- to abandon an area of land being a portion of an 
unnamed 20-foot wide alley accessed from West Market Street and traversing City 
Parking Lot 11 

 • Ordinance No. 2400 -1st reading - pursuant to Chapter 17.228 of Title 17, Zoning of the 
Salisbury Municipal Code and Section 4.04 of Article 66b of the Annotated Code of 
Maryland for the purpose of amending Section 17.216.080, Wall Signage permitted in                 
the Office and Service Residential District 

  
6:55 p.m. PUBLIC COMMENTS 
  
7:00 p.m. ADJOURNMENT 
  
 

 
     Copies of the agenda items are available for review in the City   
       Clerk’s Office, Room 305 - City/County Government Office  
               Building, 410-548-3140 or on the City’s website    
                                            www.salisbury.md   
 City Council meetings are conducted in open session unless otherwise  
 indicated.  All or part of the Council’s meetings can be held in Closed 
   Session under the authority of the Maryland Open Meetings Law,     
 Annotated Code of Maryland 10-508(a), by vote of the City Council. 

                                

                                
                                                                        

                                          Proposed agenda items for August 22, 2016 Meeting 
 

• Resolution No. 2650- Rt 13 Dagsboro Rd Annexation  
• Resolution No. 2651- Rt 13 Dagsboro Rd Annexation Plan 
• Ordinance No. 2397 – 2nd reading- amending Sections 8.11.020 of Chapter 8.11 The Fire Prevention Code; 

15.04.010 of Chapter 15.04 Building Code, 15.12.020 of Chapter 15.12 Electrical Standards; 15.24.040 of Chapter 
15.24 Housing Standards 

• Ordinance No. 2398 -2nd reading- approving an amendment of the FY17 Budget to appropriate funds for traffic 
equipment repairs and maintenance 

• Ordinance No. 2399 – 2nd reading- to abandon an area of land being a portion of an unnamed 20-foot wide alley 
accessed from West Market Street and traversing City Parking Lot 11 

• Public Hearing - Ordinance No. 2400 – 2nd reading- pursuant to Chapter 17.228 of Title 17, Zoning of the Salisbury 
Municipal Code and Section 4.04 of Article 66b of the Annotated Code of Maryland for the purpose of amending 
Section 17.216.080, Wall Signage permitted in the Office and Service Residential District 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Posted: 8/4/16  

http://www.salisbury.md/


























RESOLUTION NO.  2652 1 
 2 
 3 
 A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND TO APPROVE A 4 
MARYLAND DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES, COMMUNITY PARKS & 5 
PLAYGROUNDS GRANT APPLICATION FOR FUNDING FOR TWO PROJECTS; PHASE 2 OF 6 
THE SALISBURY SKATEPARK, AND FUNDING ASSISTANCE FOR THE WEST 7 
SALISBURY LITTLE LEAGUE BALL FIELD LIGHTING PROJECT. 8 
 9 
 WHEREAS,  the Maryland Department of Natural Resources (DNR) has solicited 10 
applications from eligible jurisdictions to apply for funding under the Community Parks & 11 
Playgrounds (CP&P) Program for Fiscal Year 2018; and 12 
 13 

WHEREAS,  the City of Salisbury is eligible to apply for CP&P funds from DNR; and 14 
 15 

WHEREAS,  the Council of the City of Salisbury recognizes the important role that our local  16 
parks, playgrounds and recreational areas play in maintaining a healthy, pleasant, attractive  17 
environment for the enjoyment of our local residents; and 18 
 19 
 WHEREAS,  the Council wishes to rehabilitate, improve and expand the parks, playgrounds 20 
and recreational areas within the City of Salisbury in order to improve the quality of life for all 21 
citizens; and 22 
 23 
 WHEREAS,  DNR has awarded a Community Parks & Playgrounds grant in the amount of 24 
$262,000 to the City of Salisbury for the Salisbury Skatepark, Phase 1 (CPP # 5980-22-206). 25 
 26 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT,  the Council of the City of Salisbury, 27 
Maryland does hereby authorize the submission of an application to the Maryland Department of 28 
Natural Resources for Community Parks & Playgrounds (CP&P) funds to forward the City’s 29 
recreational initiatives.  This will be accomplished by applying for CP&P funds for two projects; 30 
$180,000 for the Salisbury Skatepark, Phase 2, and $25,000 for the West Salisbury Little League Ball 31 
Field Lighting Project. 32 
 33 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT, Jacob R. Day, Mayor, is authorized and empowered 34 
to execute any and all documents required for the submission of this grant application. 35 
  36 
 THE ABOVE RESOLUTION was introduced and duly passed at a meeting of the Council of 37 
the City of Salisbury, Maryland held on August 8, 2016, and is to become effective immediately. 38 
 39 
 40 
 41 
______________________________   ____________________________ 42 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath  43 
CITY CLERK      CITY COUNCIL PRESIDENT 44 
 45 
 46 
APPROVED BY ME THIS 47 
 48 
___________  day of August, 2016. 49 
 50 
 51 
________________________________ 52 
Jacob R. Day 53 
MAYOR 54 



   

  
INTER  

MEMO 
 
 
 
 
 

OFFICE 
 

 OFFICE OF THE MAYOR 
 
To:  Tom Stevenson, City Administrator 
From: Julia Glanz, Assistant City Administrator 
Subject: Human Rights Advisory Committee 
Date: August 4, 2016 

 
 
Attached you will find a resolution to create a Human Rights Advisory Committee.  This 
committee will be charged with advising the Mayor on equity and inclusionary strategies that 
will strengthen connections among diverse communities living in the City. This Committee will 
advocate for citizens on the city, state, and federal levels who have been victims of 
discrimination, protecting the right and opportunity of all persons to be free from all forms of 
discrimination, and more.  This committee will be made up of key stakeholders in the City, along 
with representatives from the LGBTQ+ community and both racial and national minorities. 
 
Unless you or the Mayor have additional questions, please advance this memorandum and 
resolution of support to the City Council for approval. 
 
Attachment 



RESOLUTION NO.____. 2653 1 
 2 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND TO ESTABLISH A 3 
HUMAN RIGHTS ADVISORY COMMITTEE. 4 
 5 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury seeks to protect the health, comfort, and convenience of their 6 
citizens regardless of age, race, color, creed, religion, national origin, ancestry, disability, marital 7 
status, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity, or physical characteristic; and 8 
 9 
WHEREAS, the City has set goals to strengthen community connections among diverse groups, 10 
establish cultural activity centers, and expand multi-cultural projects and programs; and 11 
 12 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury saw a reported two (2) hate crimes for the year of 2014; and 13 
 14 
WHEREAS, the Bureau of Justice reports that, nationally, only 44% of hate crimes were 15 
reported to police; and 16 
 17 
WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council deem it in the best interest of its citizens to enact 18 
legislation to support and advocate for any citizens who feel they have been victim to hate crime 19 
or an act of discrimination; and 20 
 21 
WHEREAS, the City seeks to establish the City of Salisbury Human Rights Committee for the 22 
advocacy of their citizens on the city, state, and federal levels. 23 
 24 
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Salisbury City Council that the City of 25 
Salisbury Human Rights Advisory Committee is hereby established and will abide by the 26 
following By-Laws: 27 

  28 

By-Laws of the City of Salisbury Human Rights Committee 29 

Section 1. Membership 30 

a. The Human Rights Advisory Committee (“the Committee”) shall consist of thirteen (13) 31 
members. The Members shall be authorized and appointed by the Mayor and approved by 32 
the Council. Membership may include independent persons of high moral character and 33 
investment or interest in the field of human rights. Anyone ages eighteen (18) and older 34 
may serve on this Committee. The membership shall include at least two (2) 35 
representatives of racial or national minorities; at least two (2) representative from the 36 
LGBTQ+ community; at least one (1) high school student; and at least two (2) members 37 
of local religious organizations. Members shall serve staggered terms of four (4) years; 38 
eight (8) members will serve three four (34) year terms beginning and ending in even 39 
years, and seven (7) members will serve four (4) year terms beginning and ending in odd 40 

Formatted: Space After:  0 pt

Formatted: Left, Space After:  0 pt

Formatted: Space After:  0 pt



years.  If a member resigns from the committee in the middle of a term, their replacement 41 
will serve the remaining length of the resigning member’s term.  42 

b. The Committee will meet at least six (6) times a year. 43 
c. At the first meeting a Chair and Vice Chair will be nominated and elected. The 44 

Chairperson shall preside at all meetings and work with the City staff member assigned to 45 
support this committee with setting the agenda. The Vice Chairperson shall preside over 46 
the meetings in the event that the Chairperson is absent.  47 

d. For any and all formal recommendations made by the Committee to the Mayor, a quorum 48 
must be present. A quorum shall be at least 51% of those members appointed. 49 

e. Members shall make every effort to attend all meetings. In the event that a member is 50 
absent from three meetings in any calendar year without either a pre-arranged excuse or 51 
an emergency, they may be recommended for removal. 52 

Section 2. Purpose 53 

a. To advise the Mayor on equity and inclusionary strategies that will strengthen 54 
connections among diverse communities living in the City. 55 

b. To protect and safeguard the right and opportunity of all persons to be free from all forms 56 
of discrimination, including discrimination based on age, race, color, creed, religion, 57 
national origin, ancestry, disability, marital status, sexual orientation, gender identity or 58 
physical characteristic. 59 

c. To advocate for citizens on the city, state, and federal levels who have been victims of 60 
discrimination. 61 

d. To identify and work with community partners to find more opportunities to create a 62 
more inclusionary, diverse community. 63 

Section 3. Definitions 64 

1. “Discriminate, Discrimination, or Discriminatory” shall mean any act, policy, 65 
advertisement, or practice which subjects any person to differential treatment as a 66 
result of that person’s actual or perceived race, color, creed, religion, national origin, 67 
ancestry, disability, age, marital status, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity, or 68 
physical characteristic.  Discrimination also includes any differential treatment 69 
because of one’s association with a person or group of people identified herein; 70 

2. “Employee” shall mean any individual employed or seeking employment from an 71 
employer; 72 

3. “Employer” shall mean any person who, for compensation, regularly employs 73 
individuals, not including the employer’s parents, spouse, or children.  For purposes 74 
of the City of Salisbury Human Rights Advisory Committee, an “employer” is also a 75 
person acting on behalf of an employer, directly or indirectly, or any employment 76 
agency. 77 

4. “Gender identity” shall mean a person’s gender-related self-identity, appearance, 78 
expression, or behavior, regardless of the person’s assigned sex at birth; 79 

5. “Person” shall mean any natural person, firm, corporation, partnership, or other 80 
organization, association, or group of persons however arranged; 81 



6. “Physical Characteristic” shall mean a bodily condition or bodily characteristic of any 82 
person which is from birth, accident, or disease, or from any natural, physical 83 
development, or any other event outside the control of that person including 84 
individual physical mannerisms, height, or weight. 85 

7. “Place of public accommodation” shall mean all establishments within the City of 86 
Salisbury which offer goods, services, accommodations, or entertainment to the 87 
public. 88 

8. “Sexual orientation” shall mean a person’s actual or perceived heterosexuality, 89 
homosexuality, asexuality, or bisexuality. 90 

Section 4. City Council Liaison 91 

One member of the City Council shall act as liaison to the Human Rights Advisory 92 
Committee and regularly attend meetings. They shall report to the full City Council on any 93 
recommendations made by the Committee and any other pertinent information. 94 

Section 5. City Staff LiasionLiaison 95 

One member of the Mayor’s Office with assistance from the Solicitor’s Office shall act as 96 
liaison to the Human Rights Advisory Committee and regularly attend meetings. They shall 97 
report to the Mayor on any recommendations made by the Committee and any other pertinent 98 
information. 99 

 100 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Salisbury City Council that the Human 101 
Rights Committee is created. 102 

THIS RESOLUTION was duly passed at a meeting of the Council of the City of 103 
Salisbury held on ___________, 2016, and is to become effective immediately upon adoption. 104 

ATTEST:; 105 

 106 

 107 

__________________________        108 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk    John R. Heath, President      109 
        Salisbury City Council 110 
 111 

APPROVED BY ME THIS:______ dDay of _______________, 2016. 112 

 113 

______________________________ 114 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 115 
 116 

Formatted: Normal

Formatted: Space After:  0 pt

Formatted: Space After:  0 pt







ORDINANCE NO. 2393 
 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND, 
PURSUANT TO CHAPTER 17.228 OF TITLE 17, ZONING OF THE 
SALISBURY MUNICIPAL CODE AND SECTION 4.04 OF ARTICLE 66B 
OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND FOR THE PURPOSE OF 
AMENDING SECTION 17.84.020 TO ADD APARTMENTS, UP TO FOUR 
UNITS, IN THE OFFICE AND SERVICE RESIDENTIAL DISTRICT. 

 
WHEREAS, the ongoing application, administration and enforcement of Title 17, 

Zoning of the Salisbury Municipal Code, demonstrates a need for periodic review, evaluation, 

and amendments that will keep Title 17 current; and 

WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council may amend Title 17, Zoning, of the Salisbury 

Municipal Code, pursuant to the authority granted by Article 66B of the Maryland Annotated 

Code and in accordance with specific provisions of Chapter 17.228, Amendments and Rezoning, 

of Title 17, Zoning; and 

WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council requested that the Salisbury Planning and 

Zoning Commission periodically review Title 17 in light of existing procedural practices and 

input from the City Council and members of the public; and 

WHEREAS, Nick Simpson, First Move Properties, LLC submitted an application to 

amend the text of Section 17.84.020 to add Apartments, up to four units, in the Office and 

Service Residential District; and 

WHEREAS, a Public Hearing on the proposed amendment was held by the Planning 

Commission in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 17.228, of Title 17, Zoning, of the 

Salisbury Municipal Code on April 21, 2016; and 

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission did recommend approval of a modified text 

amendment to Section 17.84. 



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF 

SALISBURY, MARYLAND, that Title 17, Zoning, of the Salisbury Municipal Code is hereby 

amended as follows:  

I.  AMEND SECTION 17.84.020, PERMITTED USES, BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING: 
 

A. APARTMENTS, UP TO FOUR UNITS, WITHIN A RESIDENTIAL USE 
BUILDING, OR IN A MIXED USE BUILDING INCLUDING OTHER 
USES PERMITTED IN THE DISTRICT 

II.  AMEND SECTION 17.168.030 (C) (2), APARTMENT STANDARDS,    PERMITTED 
DENSITY, OFFICE AND SERVICE RESIDENTIAL, BY DELETING IT IN ITS 
ENTIRETY.      

 
AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 

MARYLAND, that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its final passage, 

but in no event until ten (10) days after the date of the Council’s Public Hearing, and 

THE ABOVE ORDINANCE was introduced at a meeting of the Council on the 11th day 

of July, 2016, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the ordinance having been published 

as required by law, in the meantime, was finally passed by the Council on the ____ day of 

____________, 2016. 

ATTEST: 
 
 
_________________________  ________________________________ 
Kimberly R. Nichols  John R. Heath, President 
City Clerk  Salisbury City Council 

 
 
Approved by me this     
            
day of                            ,  2016. 
   
                                            
_________________________ 
Jacob R. Day 
Mayor of the City of Salisbury 







ORDINANCE NO. 2396 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY TO DESIGNATE NO AND RESTRICTED 3 
PARKING ZONES ON A PORTION OF PRINCE STREET BETWEEN ROGER STREET AND 4 
SPRING AVENUE AND ON SPRING AVENUE BETWEEN PRINCE STREET AND BETHEL 5 
STREET. 6 
 7 
WHEREAS, the Principal at Prince Street Elementary School has requested consideration for no and 8 
restricted parking zones around the school to facilitate student drop off and pick up; and 9 
 10 
WHEREAS, on-street vehicular parking adjacent to the school property during student drop off and pick 11 
up could create a potentially unsafe condition for buses, vehicles in the travel lanes and students; and 12 
 13 
WHEREAS, it is beneficial to improve street traffic flow by creating a parent drop off queue lane along 14 
Prince Street; and 15 
 16 
WHEREAS, the Public Works Department recommends designating a No Parking zone between the side 17 
entrance to the school and the car drop off entrance on the south side of Prince Street to create a car drop 18 
off queue lane; and 19 
 20 
WHEREAS, the Public Works Department recommends restricting the timing of parking on a portion of 21 
the south side of Prince Street along the school property between the car drop off entrance and the Spring 22 
Avenue to disallow parking Monday thru Friday between 7:00 to 8:30 am and 1:30 to 3:00 pm; and  23 
 24 
WHEREAS, the Public Works Department recommends restricting the timing of parking on the west side 25 
of Spring Avenue between Prince Street and Bethel Street to disallow parking Monday thru Friday 26 
between 7:00 to 8:30 am and 1:30 to 3:00 pm.  27 
 28 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 29 
MARYLAND to designate restricted parking zones on Prince Street and Spring Avenue as shown on 30 
attached Exhibit A.  31 
 32 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall take effect immediately upon passage. 33 
 34 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of Salisbury held on 35 
the 1st day of August, 2016, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the Ordinance having been 36 
published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the ____ day of _________, 2016. 37 
 38 
ATTEST 39 
 40 
___________________________________ __________________________________ 41 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 42 
Salisbury City Council 43 
 44 
 45 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2016. 46 
 47 
___________________________________ 48 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 49 



WEEKDAYS

7:00 TO 8:30 AM

1:30 TO 3:00 PM

Exhibit A
Prince Street Elementary School

Restricted Parking Areas

No Parking Zone with painted queue lane between two 
school entrances along a portion of the south side of Prince 
Street.

Restricted Parking Zone with no parking on Weekdays 
between 7:00 to 8:30 am and 1:30 to 3:00 pm.
Areas include:
• Portion of the south side of Prince Street between Roger 

Street and Spring Avenue along the school property.
• West side of Spring Avenue between Prince Street and 

Bethel Street along the school property.





Ordinance No. 2397 1 
 2 

 AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY AMENDING SECTIONS 8.11.020 3 
OF CHAPTER 8.11 THE FIRE PREVENTION CODE; 15.04.010 OF CHAPTER 15.04 4 
BUILDING CODE, 15.12.020 OF CHAPTER 15.12 ELECTRICAL STANDARDS; 15.24.040 5 
OF CHAPTER 15.24 HOUSING STANDARDS. 6 
 7 
 WHEREAS, the ongoing application, administration and enforcement of Title 8, Health 8 
and Safety, and Title 15, Buildings and Construction, of the Salisbury Municipal Code, 9 
demonstrates a need for its periodic review, evaluation and amendment to keep them current; and 10 
 11 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council may amend Chapter 15.04, Building Code, 12 
pursuant to the authority granted in SC 2-15 of the Salisbury City Charter and § 12-501, et seq. 13 
of the Public Safety Article, Maryland Annotated Code and related COMAR regulations; and 14 
 15 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council have requested that the Department of 16 
Building, Permits and Inspections periodically review the Code in light of existing building 17 
trends and practices and code updates; and 18 
 19 
 WHEREAS, the Department of Building, Permits and Inspections does recommend 20 
approval of the proposed code changes. 21 
 22 
 NOW, THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained by the Council of the City of 23 
Salisbury, Maryland, that Sections 8.11.020 of Chapter 8.11 the Fire Prevention Code; 15.04.010 24 
and 15.04.020 of Chapter 15.04 Building Code, 15.12.020 of Chapter 15.12 Electrical Standards; 25 
15.24.040 of Chapter 15.24 Housing Standards be amended as follows: 26 
 27 
 28 
Chapter 8.11 - The Fire Prevention Code 29 
 30 
 31 
 32 
8.11.020 - Amendments to the State Fire Prevention Code.  33 
 34 

A. The NFPA 101 Life Safety Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is 35 
adopted with state amendments with the exception of COMAR 20.06.04 - Fees for Fire 36 
Prevention Services.  37 

 38 
B. The NFPA 1 Fire Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is adopted 39 

with state and local amendments. The local amendments are:  40 
     1. The Board of Appeals shall be the Building Board of Adjustments & Appeals. 41 

2. Any person who fails to comply with the provisions of the Code or who fails to 42 
carry out an order made pursuant to this Code or violates any condition attached 43 
to a permit, approval, or certificate may be subject to a municipal infraction not to 44 
exceed $500.00 each day the violation continues.  45 



3. Failure to comply with the time limits of an abatement notice or other corrective 46 
notice issued by the authority having jurisdiction may result in municipal 47 
infractions not to exceed $500.00 each day the violation/s continues and the 48 
jurisdiction shall have authority as provided by law to evacuate, vacate and order 49 
such building or structure to be closed to the public.  50 

4. Amend Section 10.11 Open Flame, Candles, Open Fires and Incinerators, to read: 51 
Open burning is prohibited within the City.  52 

 53 
C.  The International Building Code (2009 2015 Edition) is incorporated by reference, and is 54 

adopted with state and local amendments.  55 
 56 
 57 
 58 
Chapter 15.04 - BUILDING CODE  59 
 60 
 61 
 15.04.010 - Adoption of standard codes.  62 
 63 
     The City of Salisbury adopts the following Standard Codes:  64 
 65 
     A. International Building Code (2015) (IBC); 66 
     B. International Residential Code (2015) (IRC); 67 
     C. International Energy Conservation Code (2015 edition)(IECC); 68 
     D. International Mechanical Code (2015)(IMC); 69 
     E. International Plumbing Code (2015)(IPC); 70 
     F. International Fuel Gas Code (2015)(IFGC); and 71 
     G.   International Existing Building Code (2015); and 72 
     H.   Maryland Accessibility Code. 73 
 74 
 75 
 76 
 77 
Chapter 15.12 - Electrical Standards 78 
 79 
 80 
15.12.020 - Adoption of standards by reference.  81 
 82 
            Except as may be provided otherwise in this chapter, the current requirements of the 83 
National Electrical Code (2014 EDITION), as revised from time to time, being the regulations of 84 
the National Board of Fire Underwriters for electric wiring and apparatus, shall be deemed to be 85 
the requirements imposed by this chapter, such National Electrical Code, as revised from time to 86 
time, being hereby adopted by reference as the electrical code of the city and being herein 87 
incorporated in its entirety by reference.  88 
 89 
 90 
 91 



Chapter 15.24 - Housing Standards 92 
 93 
 94 
15.24.040 - Referenced standards.  95 
 96 

A. Where the following codes are referenced within this code, they shall be considered part 97 
of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference:  98 
 99 
1. International Building Code (2015) (IBC). The following additions and deletions 100 

are made to the International Building Code (2015):  101 
  a.  Chapter 1, Section 101.2.1 Appendix and replace with the following:  102 
 Paragraph 101.2.1 Appendix provisions on Appendix I, Patio Covers, and Appendix B, 103 
Board of Appeals are adopted as part of the IBC.  104 
 105 
  b.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.1 Gas.  106 
  c.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  107 
  d.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance.  108 
  e.  Chapter 1, delete Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection.  109 
  f.  Chapter 1, delete:  110 
 111 
 Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. 112 
  113 
 2. Fences not over six feet (6') high.  114 
 115 
 Replace with the following:  116 
 117 
 105.2 Work exempt from permit.  118 
 119 
 2. Fences less than fifty (50) lineal feet.  120 
 121 
  g.  Chapter 1, add Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit:  122 
 123 
 14. Replacement windows, doors, vinyl/aluminum siding and custom trim.  124 
 125 
 Exception: Windows being replaced in bedrooms shall not be reduced in size or shall 126 
comply with the minimum requirements of Section 102.6 Existing Structures.  127 
 128 
  h.  Chapter 1, delete Section 110.3.5 Lath and Gypsum Board Inspection.  129 
 2. International Residential Code (2015)(IRC); 130 
 3. International Energy Conservation Code (2015)(IECC); 131 
 4. International Mechanical Code (2015)(IMC); 132 
 5. International Plumbing Code (2015)(IPC); 133 
 6. International Fuel Gas Code (2015)(IFGC); 134 
 7. International Existing Building Code (2015(IEBC)). 135 
 6.  Maryland Accessibility Code. 136 
 7.  National Electric Code (2009). 137 



 8.  National Fuel Gas Code 2009 Edition. 138 
9.  National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) 101 Life Safety Code (2009) is 139 
incorporated by reference, and is adopted with state amendments with the exception of 140 
COMAR 20.06.04 - Fees for Fire Prevention Services.  141 
10.  National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Fire Code (2009) is incorporated by 142 
reference, and is adopted with state and local amendments. The local amendments are:  143 

 a.  The Board of Appeals shall be the Building Board of Adjustments & Appeals. 144 
b.  Any person who fails to comply with the provisions of the Code or who fails to carry 145 
out an order made pursuant to this Code or violates any condition attached to a permit 146 
approval, or certificate may be subject to a municipal infraction not to exceed $500.00 147 
each day the violation continues.  148 
c.  Failure to comply with the time limits of an abatement notice or other corrective 149 
notice issued by the authority having jurisdiction may result in municipal infractions not 150 
to exceed $500.00 each day the violation/s continues and the jurisdiction shall have 151 
authority as provided by law to evacuate, vacate and order such building or structure to 152 
be closed to the public.  153 
d.  Amend Section 10.11 Open Flame, Candles, Open Fires and Incinerators, to read: 154 
Open burning is prohibited within the City.  155 

 11.  State of Maryland Fire Protection Code (2009). 156 
 157 

B. Where differences occur between provisions of this code and referenced standards, this 158 
code shall apply. Additionally, nothing herein shall be construed to repeal, modify or set 159 
aside any provisions of the city's zoning code.  160 

 161 
 162 
 AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE 163 
CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND, that the Ordinance shall take effect ___________ ____, 164 
2016. 165 
 166 
 THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 167 
Salisbury held on the ______ day of ___________, 2016 and thereafter, a statement of the 168 
substance of the ordinance having been published as required by law, in the meantime, was 169 
finally passed by the Council on the ___ day of _____________, 2016.  170 
 171 
ATTEST: 172 

 173 
_________________________   _________________________ 174 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk   John R. Heath, City Council President 175 
 176 
 177 
 178 
Approved by me, this ________day of ______________, 2016. 179 
 180 
 181 
__________________________ 182 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor  183 





ORDINANCE NO. 2398 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING AN AMENDMENT OF 3 
THE FY17 BUDGET TO APPROPRIATE FUNDS FOR TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT REPAIRS 4 
AND MAINTENANCE. 5 
 6 
WHEREAS, as a result of a work performed by the Wicomico County Board of Education at the 7 
entrance to Parkside High School, improvements were required at a City of Salisbury owned 8 
traffic signal on Beaglin Park Drive; and 9 
 10 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury Traffic Division of the Public Works Department made the 11 
necessary repairs to the traffic signal; and 12 
 13 
WHEREAS, the Wicomico County Board of Education reimbursed the City for actual expenses; 14 
and 15 
 16 
WHEREAS, the Traffic Division budget should be increased to accommodate these efforts. 17 
 18 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 19 
SALISBURY, MARYLAND that the City’s Fiscal Year 2017 budget and Traffic Division 20 
Equipment budget be and are hereby amended as follows: 21 
 22 

1. Increase the Miscellaneous Revenue (01000-456911) account by $5,139.00 23 
2. Increase the Traffic Equipment (22000-534302) budget by $5,139.00 24 

 25 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its 26 
final passage. 27 
 28 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of Salisbury 29 
held on the ___ day of _________, 2016, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the 30 
Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the 31 
___ day of ________, 2016. 32 
 33 
 34 
ATTEST 35 
 36 
 37 
___________________________________ __________________________________ 38 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk John R. Heath, President 39 

Salisbury City Council 40 
 41 
 42 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2016. 43 
 44 
___________________________________ 45 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 46 





ORDINANCE NO. 2399 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND TO ABANDON AN AREA OF 3 
LAND BEING A PORTION OF AN UNNAMED 20 FOOT WIDE ALLEY ACCESSED FROM WEST 4 
MARKET STREET AND TRAVERSING CITY PARKING LOT 11. 5 
 6 
WHEREAS, The unnamed alley, is shown on the plat entitled “Map of Property of the Salisbury Realty 7 
Co.”, dated February 28, 1920 and recorded among the Land Records of Wicomico County, Maryland, in 8 
Plat Cabinet 117, Folio 999 is incorporated into the layout of City Parking Lot 11; and 9 
 10 
WHEREAS, the portion of the unnamed alley to be abandoned is adjoined by City owned Parcels 1074, 11 
1075, 1076, 1077, 1078 and 1079 that along with the unnamed alley make up the developed area of City 12 
Parking Lot 11; and 13 
 14 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury Department of Public Works has determined that the abandonment of a 15 
portion of the unnamed alley is in the best interest of the City in order to improve the potential of Lot 11 16 
for development; and 17 
 18 
WHEREAS, the Salisbury Charter SC11-2 gives the City of Salisbury charge of all public ways in the 19 
City of Salisbury; and 20 
 21 
WHEREAS, the Salisbury Charter SC16-8 allows the City of Salisbury to abandon or otherwise dispose 22 
of property that is not saleable; and 23 
 24 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury Department of Public Works has prepared and the City Solicitor has 25 
reviewed the Plat to abandon the unnamed alley and revert the 20 foot width of the portions of the 26 
unnamed alley fronting on Parcels 1075 and 1074 to these City owned Parcels; a copy of which is 27 
attached hereto as Exhibit “A”. 28 
 29 
WHEREAS, the Director of Public Works provided the City Council a recommendation of the proposed 30 
road abandonment at the July 18, 2016 City Council work session; 31 
 32 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 33 
MARYLAND that the City of Salisbury hereby abandons the 4,135.2 square foot area of the heretofore 34 
described unnamed alley, and that the Mayor of the City of Salisbury is hereby authorized to execute the 35 
attached Exhibit “A” to convey to the area to aforementioned City owned parcels. 36 
 37 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall take effect immediately. 38 
 39 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of Salisbury held on 40 
the ___ day of ________, 2016, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the Ordinance having been 41 
published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the ____ day of _________, 2016. 42 
 43 
ATTEST 44 
 45 
             46 
Kimberly R. Nichols      John R. Heath 47 
CITY CLERK       PRESIDENT, City Council 48 
 49 
Approved by me this ___ day of ________________, 2016 50 
 51 
 52 
     53 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 54 



EX
H

IB
IT

 A



Legal Descriptions for 20’ Unnamed Alley in Parking Lot 11 to be Closed 

 

Portion To Be Added to Parcel 1074 

Beginning for the same at a point on the northerly line of a 20’ unnamed alley, which is part of 
the City of Salisbury “Parking Lot 11”, at the southwesterly corner of the lands of the City of 
Salisbury (P.1074). Thence by and with the northerly line of the said alley the following three 
courses: (1) North 46 degrees 44 minutes 38 seconds East a distance of 33.58 feet, more or less, 
to a point. (2) Thence with a curve to the right, having a radius of 36.33 feet, a length of 14.54 
feet to a point. (3) Thence North 69 degrees 40 minutes 36 seconds East a distance of 104.41 feet 
to a point at the southwesterly corner of the lands of REPC & HTC, LLC. (4) Thence crossing 
the said alley South 20 degrees 19 minutes 24 seconds East a distance of 20.00 feet to the point 
on the south line of the said alley. (5) Thence with a line being 20’ southeasterly of and parallel 
to the herein third described line, reversed, South 69 degrees 40 minutes 36 seconds West a 
distance of 104.39 feet to a point. (6) Thence with a curve to the left, having a radius of 16.36 
feet, a length of 6.55 feet to a point. (7) Thence with a line being 20’ southeasterly of and parallel 
to the herein first described line, reversed, South 46 degrees 44 minutes 38 seconds West a 
distance of 42.68 feet, more or less, to a point at the intersection of the southerly line of the said 
alley and the extended line between P.1074 and P.1075. (8) Thence with the said extended line 
between P.1074 and P.1075 to the point of beginning. Being shown on a plat entitled “Road 
Closure Sketch, 20-FT Unnamed Alley” as the easterly portion of the “20’ Unnamed Alley To 
Be Closed” and containing 3,075.2 square feet, more or less. 

 

 

Portion To Be Added to Parcel 1075 

Beginning for the same at a point on the northerly line of a 20’ unnamed alley, which is part of 
the City of Salisbury “Parking Lot 11”, at the southeasterly corner of the lands of the City of 
Salisbury (P.1075). (1) Thence by and with the northerly line of the said alley South 46 degrees 
44 minutes 38 seconds West a distance of 62.50 feet, more or less, to a point on the northerly 
right of way line (curve) of Market Street. (2) Thence by and with the said line of Market Street 
and a curve to the left, having a radius of 64.80 feet, a length of 22.45 feet to a point at the 
southerly line of the said alley. (3) Thence with a line being 20’ southeasterly of and parallel to 
the herein first described line, reversed, North 46 degrees 44 minutes 38 seconds East a distance 
of 43.45 feet to a point at the intersection of the southerly line of the said alley and the extended 
line between P.1074 and P.1075. (8) Thence with the said extended line between P.1074 and 
P.1075 to the point of beginning. Being shown on a plat entitled “Road Closure Sketch, 20-FT 
Unnamed Alley” as the westerly portion of the “20’ Unnamed Alley To Be Closed” and 
containing 1,060.0 square feet, more or less. 













































ORDINANCE NO. 2400 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND, 3 
PURSUANT TO CHAPTER 17.228 OF TITLE 17, ZONING OF THE 4 
SALISBURY MUNICIPAL CODE AND SECTION 4.04 OF ARTICLE 66B 5 
OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND FOR THE PURPOSE OF 6 
AMENDING SECTION 17.216.080, WALL SIGNAGE PERMITTED IN 7 
THE OFFICE AND SERVICE RESIDENTIAL DISTRICT. 8 

 9 
WHEREAS, the ongoing application, administration and enforcement of Title 17, 10 

Zoning of the Salisbury Municipal Code, demonstrates a need for periodic review, evaluation, 11 

and amendments that will keep Title 17 current; and 12 

WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council may amend Title 17, Zoning, of the Salisbury 13 

Municipal Code, pursuant to the authority granted by Article 66B of the Maryland Annotated 14 

Code and in accordance with specific provisions of Chapter 17.228, Amendments and Rezoning, 15 

of Title 17, Zoning; and 16 

WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council requested that the Salisbury Planning and 17 

Zoning Commission periodically review Title 17 in light of existing procedural practices and 18 

input from the City Council and members of the public; and 19 

WHEREAS, The Wicomico Presbyterian Church submitted an application to amend the 20 

text of Section 17.216.080 regarding Wall Signage permitted for Churches in the Office and 21 

Service Residential District; and 22 

WHEREAS, a Public Hearing on the proposed amendments was held by the Planning 23 

Commission in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 17.228, of Title 17, Zoning, of the 24 

Salisbury Municipal Code on May 19, 2016; and 25 

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission did recommend approval of the proposed text 26 

amendment to Sections 17.216.080. 27 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF 28 

SALISBURY, MARYLAND, that Title 17, Zoning, of the Salisbury Municipal Code is hereby 29 

amended as follows: 30 

AMEND SECTION 17.216.080 BY ADDING ITEM D AS FOLLOWS: 31 
 32 
D. ONE (1) SQUARE FOOT OF WALL SIGNAGE PER LINEAR FOOT OF 33 

BUILDING WIDTH UP TO A MAXIMUM OF 30 SQ. FT. OF NON-34 
ILLUMINATED OR INDIRECTLY ILLUMINATED SIGNAGE FOR 35 



CHURCHES OR CHURCH SOCIAL OR RECEPTION HALLS, OR CHURCH-36 
RELATED BUILDINGS. 37 

 38 
AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 39 

MARYLAND, that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its final passage, 40 

but in no event until ten (10) days after the date of the Council’s Public Hearing, and 41 

THE ABOVE ORDINANCE was introduced at a meeting of the Council on the 42 

____day of ______, 2016, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the ordinance having 43 

been published as required by law, in the meantime, was finally passed by the Council on the 44 

____ day of ____________, 2016. 45 

 46 
ATTEST: 47 
 48 
 49 
_________________________  ________________________________ 50 
Kimberly R. Nichols  John R. Heath, President 51 
City Clerk  Salisbury City Council 52 

 53 
 54 
Approved by me this 55 
 56 
______ day of                            ,  2016. 57 
 58 
 59 
_________________________ 60 
Jacob R. Day 61 
Mayor of the City of Salisbury 62 


	Agenda

	Res2652

	Res2653

	Ord2393-2nd R &  PUBLIC HEARING 

	Ord2396-2nd R

	Ord2397-1st R

	Ord2398-1st R

	Ord2399-1st R

	Ord2400-1st R


